Item #1 Stone

Description Vulcgn Davis Crushed Corydon Stone
Materials | Stone and Lime | & Asphalt Inc.
INDOT #2 $6.75 $5.80 $6.00
INDOT #5 $6.75 $5.80 $6.00
INDOT #8 $7.15 $6.20
INDOT #9 $5.80 $6.85
INDOT #11 $8.00 $5.80 $7.60
INDOT #12 $7.90
INDOT #43 $6.20
INDOT #91 $6.20
INDOT #53 $6.65 $5.80 $6.20
INDOT #73 $6.65 $5.80 $6.20
Shot $6.50 $4.60 $5.45
Rip Rap $7.75 $5.80 $7.15
Pugmill $6.95
Crushed Lime $5.50 $5.80 $5.10
Ag Lime $5.50 $5.80 $5.10
Dirt $2.00
#201 $4.50
Asphalt Sand $11.20
Surge Rock $5.60
Crusher Run $6.75 $6.20
Hourly Delivery Rate $85.00 $65.00 $75.00

***Recommend accepting all bids.***




Item #2 Cold Mix Asphalt (CMA)

Corydon Stone &
Asphalt Inc.

Item Description

Unit Price per Ton
F.O.B. at the Plant

Size 2 No Bid
Size 5 No Bid
Size 8 No Bid
Size 9 No Bid
Size 11 $95.00
Size 5D No Bid

***Recommend accepting CSA’s bid***




Item #3 Base Stabilization and/or Dust Control

No Bids Received




Item #4 HMA Pavement

MAC Construction CEnyen S
Item Description Asphalting.
P Unit Price per Ton Unit Price per Ton
F.O.B. at the Plant F.O.B. at the Plant
HMA Base $40.00 $46.00
HMA Intermediate $43.00 $46.00
HMA Surface $45.00 $48.00
Hourly Delivery Rate | $75.00 $80.00

***Recommend accepting all bids.***




Item #5 Pavement Markings

Atlantic Construction

Interstate Road

Item Description Management
Unit Price per LFT Unit Price per LFT
Line, Traffic Paint, Solid, White, 4-inch $0.098 $0.090
Line, Traffic Paint, Broken, White, 4-inch $0.080 $0.090
Line, Traffic Paint, Solid, Yellow, 4-inch $0.080 $0.090
Line, Traffic Paint, Broken, Yellow, 4-inch $0.080 $0.090
Line, Thermoplastic, Solid, White, 4-inch $0.750 No Bid
Line, Thermoplastic, Broken, White, 4-inch $0.750 No Bid
Line, Thermoplastic, Solid, Yellow, 4-inch $0.750 No Bid
Line, Thermoplastic, Broken, Yellow, 4-inch $0.750 No Bid

***Recommend accepting Atlantic Construction’s bid.***




Item #6 Guardrail

. James H. Drew CPI
Unit
Item Description Price
New Guardrail

10 Ga. Guardrail 12' 6" Galv. w/Hdw. LF $10.20 No Bid
12 Ga. Guardrail 12' 6" Galv. w/Hdw. LF $8.25 $9.68

12 Ga. Guardrail 12' 6" Galv. (Shop Curved) w/Hdw. LF $10.20 No Bid
Michigan End Shoe Each $41.00 No Bid
Standard End Wings Each $36.00 $40.80
Posts 4" x 6" x 6' 0" Galv. w/Hdw. Each $50.00 No Bid
Posts 4" x 6" x 7' 0" Galv. w/Hdw. Each $57.00 $59.84
Posts 6" x 6" x 6' 3" Galv. w/Hdw. Each $172.00 No Bid
Offset Brackets 4" x 6" Each $18.75 $13.60
Offset Brackets 6" x 6" Each $34.00 No Bid
"C" Splice Plates Each $102.00 $129.20
Bridge Posts 6" x 6" x Length, Galv. LF $37.80 No Bid
Bridge Inserts for Bridge Rail Posts (3/4" - Furnished & Installed) Each $37.28 No Bid
Bridge Post Spacers Each $7.88 No Bid
3/4" Bridge Post Hardware Each $5.51 No Bid
5" Channel, Galv., Punched 6' 3" LF $14.00 No Bid
25' 0" x 12 Ga New Guardrail LF $8.00 $8.92

Used Guardrail - If Available
12 Ga. Guardrail w/Hardware LF $2.35 No Bid
4" x 6" x5'9" or 6' 0" Posts w/Hdw., painted Each $8.00 No Bid
4" x 6" x5'9" or 6' 0" Posts w/Hdw., galv. Each $12.00 No Bid
6" x 6" x 6' 3" Posts Galv. w/Hdw. Each $18.00 No Bid
Offset Brackets 4" x 6" Each $4.00 No Bid
Offset Brackets 6" x 6" Each $7.50 No Bid
End Wings w/Hardware, Galv. Each $15.00 No Bid
Michigan End Shoe Each $18.50 No Bid
"C" Splice Plates Each $21.00 No Bid
Channel, Galv. LF $2.75 No Bid
Installation Prices

1-300LF $1,600 Minimum No Bid
301 - 500 LF LF $4.50 No Bid
501 - 750 LF LF $4.35 No Bid
751 - 1,000 LF LF $4.20 No Bid
Over 1,000 LF LF $4.00 No Bid
Installation of Buried End Each $50.00 No Bid

***Recommend accepting James H. Drew’s bid.***




Item #7 Corrugated Metal Pipe

2-2/3" x 1/2" Spiral Corrugated Steel Pipe
CPI St. Regis CPI St. Regis
Pipe Size - n Pipe Size - n
(Diameter) Unit Price per LFT (Span-Rise) Unit Price per LFT
Type ll . Polymer Type ll . Polymer Type ll . Polymer Type ll . Polymer
calv | Alum | Aluminum | Coated Galv | Alum | Aluminum | Coated Galv | Alum | Aluminum | Coated calv | Alum | Aluminum | Coated
16 Gage (.064) 16 Gage (.064)
12" $7.96 $9.61 11.89 15.63 $8.82 $9.52 No Bid No Bid
15" $9.94 12.13 14.93 19.53 10.58 11.42 No Bid No Bid 17" x 13" 11.10 13.51 17.98 21.74 11.32 12.24 No Bid No Bid
18" 11.91 14.43 18.16 23.41 13.23 14.28 No Bid No Bid 21" x 15" 13.28 16.13 21.48 26.05 14.15 15.30 No Bid No Bid
21" 14.06 16.81 21.71 27.33 14.99 16.18 No Bid No Bid 24" x 18" 15.68 18.74 25.60 30.42 16.03 17.34 No Bid No Bid
24" 15.81 19.08 24.61 31.21 16.76 18.09 No Bid No Bid 28" x 20" 17.6: 21.25 No Bid 34.75 17.92 19.38 No Bid No Bid
30" 19.74 23.80 No Bid 38.95 21.17 22.85 No Bid No Bid 35" x 24" 22.0! 26.55 No Bid 43.41 22.63 24.48 No Bid No Bid
36" 23.58 28.44 No Bid $46.28 25.58 27.61 No Bid No Bid 42" x 29" 26.30 31.73 No Bid 51.49 27.35 29.58 No Bid No Bid
42" 27.54 33.20 No Bid 53.99 29.99 32.37 No Bid No Bid 49" x 33" 30.73 37.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" 31.41 37.88 No Bid 61.50 33.52 36.18 No Bid No Bid 57" x 38" 35.05 $42.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Gage (.079) 14 Gage (.079)
12" 10.14 12.04 14.65 18.55 10.58 11.42 No Bid No Bid
15" 12.58 14.91 18.44 23.17 13.23 14.28 No Bid No Bid 17"x13" 14.04 16.63 21.86 25.78 14.15 15.30 No Bid No Bid
18" 15.00 17.80 22.36 27.79 15.88 17.14 No Bid No Bid 21"x15" 16.73 19.84 26.15 30.94 16.97 18.36 No Bid No Bid
21" 17.43 20.68 26.59 32.37 18.52 19.99 No Bid No Bid 24"x18" 19.44 23.05 31.03 36.18 19.80 21.42 No Bid No Bid
24" 19.44 23.56 30.20 37.04 21.17 22.85 No Bid No Bid 28"x20" 21.66 26.29 35.60 41.42 22.63 24.48 No Bid No Bid
30" 24.80 29.33 38.76 $46.19 26.46 28.56 No Bid No Bid 35"x24" 27.65 32.71 $45.10 51.65 28.29 30.60 No Bid No Bid
36" 29.76 35.09 48.30 55.43 31.75 34.27 No Bid No Bid 42"x29" 33.21 39.11 No Bid 62.00 33.95 36.72 No Bid No Bid
42" 34.43 40.85 No Bid 64.61 37.04 39.98 No Bid No Bid 49"x33" 38.39 45.56 No Bid 72.25 39.61 $42.84 No Bid No Bid
48" 39.26 46.59 No Bid 73.84 42.34 45.70 No Bid No Bid 57"x38" $43.80 52.00 No Bid 82.58 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" 544.09 52.31 No Bid 83.06 47.63 51.41 No Bid No Bid 64"x43" 49.18 58.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Gage (.109) 12 Gage (.109)
18" 20.25 24.70 No Bid No Bid 21.96 23.64 No Bid No Bid
21" 23.55 28.71 No Bid $41.65 26.54 28.57 No Bid No Bid 24" x 18" 26.29 32.03 No Bid 45.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" 26.83 32.69 40.89 $47.57 30.20 32.51 No Bid No Bid 28" x 20" 29.85 36.48 47.48 51.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" 33.38 40.68 52.06 59.46 37.52 $40.39 No Bid No Bid 35" x 24" 37.23 45.48 59.90 64.92 41.41 No Bid No Bid No Bid
36" 39.91 48.69 68.03 71.42 44.84 48.27 No Bid No Bid 42" x 29" $44.54 54.31 74.98 77.99 49.49 53.41 No Bid No Bid
42" $46.43 56.60 75.63 83.43 52.16 56.15 No Bid No Bid 49" x 33" 51.78 63.14 88.75 91.09 57.57 62.13 No Bid No Bid
48" 52.99 64.63 85.55 95.32 61.49 66.04 No Bid No Bid 57" x 38" 59.11 72.11 No Bid $104.08 65.65 70.85 No Bid No Bid
54" 59.61 72.60 $101.83 107.20 69.06 74.17 No Bid No Bid 64" x 43" 66.48 80.98 No Bid $117.03 73.73 79.57 No Bid No Bid
60" 66.06 80.56 No Bid 119.17 76.63 82.30 No Bid No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid 131.68 84.19 90.42 No Bid No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
10 Gage (.138) 10 Gage (.138)
30" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 56.10 59.67 No Bid No Bid
36" 50.41 61.49 $81.30 $86.03 68.20 72.54 No Bid No Bid 42" x 29" No Bid No Bid $93.86 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42" 58.66 71.56 $95.46 100.49 79.20 84.24 No Bid No Bid 49" x 33" 65.46 $79.84 $110.83 109.17 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" 66.91 81.64 $108.29 114.88 90.20 95.94 No Bid No Bid 57" x 38" 74.65 $91.08 130.03 124.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" 75.13 91.63 127.40 129.17 110.40 116.84 No Bid No Bid 64" x 43" 83.85 $102.23 144.59 140.32 | $121.44 | $127.88 No Bid No Bid
60" 83.43 101.74 140.30 143.64 123.60 130.81 No Bid No Bid 71" x 47" 93.09 113.54 No Bid 156.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" 91.70 111.84 No Bid 157.69 135.60 143.51 No Bid No Bid 77" x 52" $102.33 124.80 No Bid 171.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" 99.86 | $121.85 No Bid 171.85 147.60 156.21 No Bid No Bid 83" x 57" $111.44 | $135.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 Gage 8 Gage
36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 198.75 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
42" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | $233.20 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 265.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 296.80 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 328.60 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 363.05 | No Bid No Bid No Bid 77" x 52" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $417.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 409.75 | No Bid No Bid No Bid 83" x 57" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $454.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 442.75 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
CPI Low Prices: 65
St. Regis Low Prices: 42
One Vendor Prices (CPI): 243
One Vendor Prices (St. Regis): 205

***Recommend accepting CPI Supply's bid.***




Iltem #7 Corrugated Metal Pipe

3" x 1" Spiral Corrugated Steel Pipe
CPI St. Regis CPI St. Regis
Pipe Size —— Pipe Size ——
(Diameter) Unit Price per LFT (Span-Rise) Unit Price per LFT
Type Il | Polymer Type Il | Polymer Type Il | Polymer Type Il | Polymer
Galv AyIFL)Jm Coiled Galv | A):IFL)Jm Co)f;ted Galv AyIFL)Jm Coiled Galv | A):IFL)Jm Co)f;ted
16 Gage (.064) 16 Gage (.064)
36" No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.75 $61.05 No Bid 42" x 29" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42" No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.25 $72.15 No Bid 49" x 33" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid $77.00 $81.40 No Bid 53" x 41" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.50 $92.50 No Bid 60" x 46" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.25 | $101.75 | No Bid 66" x 51" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid $105.00 | $111.00 No Bid 73" x 55" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $115.50 | $122.10 | No Bid 81" x 59" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid $124.25 | $131.35 No Bid 87" x 63" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $134.75 | $142.45 | No Bid 95" x 67" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90" No Bid No Bid No Bid $143.50 | $151.70 No Bid 103" x 71" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $152.25 | $160.95 | No Bid 112" x 75" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102" No Bid No Bid No Bid $162.75 | $172.05 No Bid 117" x 79" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Gage (.079) 14 Gage (.079)
36" No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.75 $75.85 No Bid
42" No Bid No Bid No Bid $82.25 $86.95 No Bid
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.50 $99.90 No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $106.75 | $112.85 | No Bid 60" x 46" No Bid No Bid No Bid [ $128.10 | $132.98 | No Bid
60" No Bid No Bid No Bid $117.25 | $123.95 No Bid 66" x 51" No Bid No Bid No Bid $140.70 | $146.06 No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $129.50 | $136.90 | No Bid 73" x 55" No Bid No Bid No Bid [ $155.40 | $161.32 | No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid $141.75 | $149.85 No Bid 81" x 59" No Bid No Bid No Bid $170.10 | $176.58 No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $165.30 | $171.39 | No Bid 87" x 63" No Bid No Bid No Bid [ $182.70 | $189.66 | No Bid
84" No Bid No Bid No Bid $178.60 | $185.18 No Bid 95" x 67" No Bid No Bid No Bid $197.40 | $204.92 No Bid
90" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $190.00 | $197.00 | No Bid 103" x 71" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $210.00 | $218.00 | No Bid
96" No Bid No Bid No Bid $203.30 | $210.79 No Bid 112" x 75" No Bid No Bid No Bid $224.70 | $233.26 No Bid
102" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $228.00 | $239.40 | No Bid
108" No Bid No Bid No Bid $240.00 | $252.00 No Bid
114" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $254.00 | $266.70 | No Bid
12 Gage (.109) 12 Gage (.109)
36" No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.00 | $117.60 No Bid
42" No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 | $136.50 No Bid
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $148.00 | $155.40 | No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid $166.00 | $174.30 No Bid 60" x 46" No Bid No Bid No Bid $182.60 | $200.86 No Bid
60" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $184.00 | $193.20 | No Bid 66" x 51" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $202.40 | $222.64 | No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid $202.00 | $212.10 No Bid 73" x 55" No Bid No Bid No Bid $222.20 | $244.42 No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $220.00 | $231.00 | No Bid 81" x 59" No Bid No Bid No Bid [ $242.00 | $266.20 | No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid $238.00 | $249.90 No Bid 87" x 63" No Bid No Bid No Bid $261.80 | $287.98 No Bid
84" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $256.00 | $268.80 | No Bid 95" x 67" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $281.60 | $309.76 [ No Bid
90" No Bid No Bid No Bid $274.00 | $287.70 No Bid 103" x 71" No Bid No Bid No Bid $301.40 | $331.54 No Bid
96" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $294.00 | $308.70 | No Bid 112" x 75" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $323.40 | $355.74 [ No Bid
102" No Bid No Bid No Bid $310.00 | $325.50 No Bid 117" x 79" No Bid No Bid No Bid $341.00 | $375.10 No Bid
108" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $330.00 | $346.50 | No Bid 128" x 83" No Bid No Bid No Bid [ $363.00 | $399.30 | No Bid
114" No Bid No Bid No Bid $348.00 [ $365.40 No Bid 137" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid $382.80 | $421.08 No Bid
120" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $366.00 | $384.30 | No Bid
10 Gage (.138) 10 Gage (.138)
36" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $142.00 | $149.10 | No Bid
42" No Bid No Bid No Bid $166.00 | $174.30 No Bid
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $190.00 | $199.50 | No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid $212.00 | $222.60 No Bid
60" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $236.00 | $247.80 | No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid $258.00 [ $270.90 No Bid 73" x 55" No Bid No Bid No Bid $283.80 | $312.18 No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $280.00 | $294.00 | No Bid 81" x 59" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $308.00 [ $338.80 | No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid $304.00 | $319.20 No Bid 87" x 63" No Bid No Bid No Bid $334.40 | $367.84 No Bid
84" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $328.00 | $344.40 | No Bid 95" x 67" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $360.80 [ $396.88 | No Bid
90" No Bid No Bid No Bid $350.00 | $367.50 No Bid 103" x 71" No Bid No Bid No Bid $385.00 | $423.50 No Bid
96" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $376.00 | $394.80 | No Bid 112" x 75" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $413.60 | $454.96 | No Bid
102" No Bid No Bid No Bid $396.00 | $415.80 No Bid 117" x 79" No Bid No Bid No Bid $435.60 | $479.16 No Bid
108" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $422.00 | $443.10 | No Bid 128" x 83" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $464.20 | $510.62 | No Bid
114" No Bid No Bid No Bid $444.00 | $466.20 No Bid 137" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid $488.40 | $537.24 No Bid
120" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $468.00 | $491.40 | No Bid 142" x 91" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $514.80 | No Bid No Bid
126" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1132" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
138" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 guage 8 Gage
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid $345.00 No Bid No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $387.00 | No Bid No Bid
60" No Bid No Bid No Bid $429.00 No Bid No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid $471.00 No Bid No Bid 73" x 55" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $513.00 | No Bid No Bid 81" x 59" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $564.30 | No Bid No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid $555.00 No Bid No Bid 87" x 63" No Bid No Bid No Bid $610.50 No Bid No Bid
84" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $597.00 | No Bid No Bid 95" x 67" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $656.70 | No Bid No Bid
90" No Bid No Bid No Bid $639.00 No Bid No Bid 103" x 71" No Bid No Bid No Bid $702.90 No Bid No Bid
96" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $684.00 | No Bid No Bid 112" x 75" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $752.40 | No Bid No Bid
102" No Bid No Bid No Bid $723.00 No Bid No Bid 117" x 79" No Bid No Bid No Bid $795.30 No Bid No Bid
108" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $768.00 | No Bid No Bid 128" x 83" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $844.80 | No Bid No Bid
114" No Bid No Bid No Bid $813.00 No Bid No Bid 137" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid $894.30 No Bid No Bid
120" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $852.00 | No Bid No Bid 142" x 91" No Bid No Bid No Bid | $937.20 | No Bid No Bid




ltem #7 Corrugated Metal Pipe

5" x 1" Spiral Corrugated Steel Pipe
CPI St. Regis CPI St. Regis
Pipe Size - - Pipe Size - -
(Diameter) Unit Price per LFT (Span-Rise) Unit Price per LFT
Type ll Type ll Type ll Type ll
Galv Ay|FL,Jm Galv AyIIlJJm Galv AyIFlJJm Galv KITJm
16 Gage (.064) 16 Gage (.064)
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60" x 46" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" $68.62 $69.51 No Bid No Bid 66" x 51" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" $87.03 $85.88 No Bid No Bid 73" x 55" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" $92.61 $91.93 No Bid No Bid 81" x 59" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" $98.17 $97.97 No Bid No Bid 87" x 63" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84" $103.68 | $103.21 | No Bid No Bid 95" x 67" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90" $109.19 | $109.26 | No Bid No Bid 103" x 71" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96" $114.78 | $115.27 | No Bid No Bid 117" x 79" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102" $120.52 | $121.45 No Bid No Bid 112" x 75" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Gage (.079) 14 Gage (.079)
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60" x 46" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" $80.89 $81.87 No Bid No Bid 66" x 51" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" $100.24 | $99.62 No Bid No Bid 73" x 55" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" $106.89 | $106.81 | No Bid No Bid 81" x 59" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" $113.79 | $114.10 | No Bid No Bid 87" x 63" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84" $120.56 | $120.56 No Bid No Bid 95" x 67" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
90" $126.64 | $127.77 | No Bid No Bid 103" x 71" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
96" $134.07 | $135.00 | No Bid No Bid 112" x 75" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
102" $140.84 | $142.25 No Bid No Bid 117" x 79" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
108" $147.54 | $149.44 No Bid No Bid 128" x 83" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
114" $154.40 | $156.74 | No Bid No Bid 137" x 87" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 Gage (.109) 12 Gage (.109)
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 60" x 46" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" $103.05 | $105.42 No Bid No Bid 66" x 51" $123.83 | $124.21 No Bid No Bid
66" $124.28 | $125.83 | No Bid No Bid 73" x 55" $134.02 | $135.50 | No Bid No Bid
72" $133.34 | $135.17 | No Bid No Bid 81" x 59" $161.34 | $167.43 | No Bid No Bid
78" $142.28 | $144.87 | No Bid No Bid 87" x 63" $172.43 | $179.34 | No Bid No Bid
84" $151.16 | $153.53 No Bid No Bid 95" x 67" $183.42 | $190.24 No Bid No Bid
90" $160.18 | $163.07 | No Bid No Bid 103" x 71" $194.38 | $202.17 | No Bid No Bid
96" $169.14 | $172.39 | No Bid No Bid 112" x 75" $205.43 | $214.08 | No Bid No Bid
102" $178.05 | $182.13 | No Bid No Bid 117" x 79" $216.67 | $226.17 | No Bid No Bid
108" $187.07 | $191.63 No Bid No Bid 128" x 83" $227.83 | $238.24 No Bid No Bid
114" $196.02 | $201.13 | No Bid No Bid 137" x 87" $241.83 | $205.82 | No Bid No Bid
120" $204.96 | $210.55 | No Bid No Bid
10 Gage (.138) 10 Gage (.138)
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" $124.81 | $130.72 | No Bid No Bid
66" $147.09 | $153.94 | No Bid No Bid
72" $158.86 | $165.82 | No Bid No Bid 81" x 59" $192.66 | $204.79 | No Bid No Bid
78" $170.24 | $177.92 No Bid No Bid 87" x 63" $206.27 | $219.73 No Bid No Bid
84" $181.40 | $188.97 | No Bid No Bid 95" x 67" $219.82 | $233.56 | No Bid No Bid
90" $192.45 | $200.98 | No Bid No Bid 103" x 71" $233.45 | $248.50 | No Bid No Bid
96" $203.60 | $212.18 | No Bid No Bid 112" x 75" $246.63 | $263.50 | No Bid No Bid
102" 214.69 $224.92 No Bid No Bid 117" x 79" $260.79 | $278.47 No Bid No Bid
108" 225.82 | $236.90 | No Bid No Bid 128" x 83" $274.59 | $293.57 | No Bid No Bid
114" 236.94 | $248.82 | No Bid No Bid 137" x 87" $291.15 | $308.62 | No Bid No Bid
120" 248.03 | $260.83 | No Bid No Bid 142" x 91" $306.79 | $325.18 | No Bid No Bid
126" 262.63 $273.03 No Bid No Bid
8 Gage 8 Gage
36" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
42" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
48" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
54" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
60" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
66" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 77" x 52" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
72" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 83" x 57" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
78" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
84" No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Item No. 8

Tires
Dubois County Tire Trusty Tires
Item No. Description Quantity L L
Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1 Drive Caps (Re-Caps) - 11R22.5 Accutread HDL or Approved Equivalent) 25 $179.00 $4,475.00 $145.00 $3,625.00
2 Steer Tires (11R22.5 Continental HSR 16 Ply or Approved Equivalent) 25 $253.73 $6,343.25 $253.73 $6,343.25
3 Drive Tires (11R22.5 Firestone T831 16 Ply or Approved Equivalent) 75 $299.76 $22,482.00 $299.76 $22,482.00
4 Service Truck (265/70R19.5 Goodyear G124 or Approved Equivalent) 6 $203.50 $1,221.00 $315.46 $1,892.76
5 Service Truck (265/70R19.5 Goodyear G159 or Approved Equivalent) 10 $203.50 $2,035.00 $283.07 $2,830.70
6 235/85R16 Firestone Transforce HT 10Ply 8 $88.00 $704.00 $88.00 $704.00
7 9.50R16.5 Firestone Transforce HT 10Ply 8 $113.49 $907.92 $113.49 $907.92
8 14.00-24 Firestone Grader 12 Ply Or Approved Equivalent 42 $508.36 $21,351.12 $468.16 $19,662.72
9 380/85R24 Firestone Radial AT DT or Approved Equivalent 20 $775.00 $15,500.00 $814.79 $16,295.80
10 |480/85R34 Firestone Radial 23 or Approved Equivalent 20 $1,025.00 $20,500.00 $1,083.33 $21,666.60
11  |19.5L-24 Firestone Utility R-4 10Ply or Approved Equivalent 2 $525.00 $1,050.00 $502.00 $1,004.00
12 |12-16.5 Firestone Duraforce HD 10Ply or Approved Equivalent 2 $235.00 $470.00 $175.00 $350.00
13 |12.5/80-18 Firestone Super Trac 12 Ply or Approved Equivalent 2 $250.00 $500.00 $250.00 $500.00
14 7.5R16 4 $88.00 $352.00 $105.00 $420.00
15 SE P175-80-R13 4 $62.00 $248.00 $38.00 $152.00
16 ST205-75-R15 4 $72.00 $288.00 $50.00 $200.00
17 ST225-75-R15 4 $83.00 $332.00 $62.00 $248.00
18 ST235-80-R16 4 $89.00 $356.00 $84.00 $336.00
19 LT225-60-R17 4 $70.00 $280.00 $75.00 $300.00
20 LT225-70-R15 4 $80.00 $320.00 $62.35 $249.40
21 LT225-75-R16 4 $110.50 $442.00 $81.30 $325.20
22 LT235-70-R15 4 $82.00 $328.00 $84.14 $336.56
23 LT235-75-R15 12 $95.00 $1,140.00 $71.01 $852.12
24 LT235-75-R16 4 $85.00 $340.00 $109.91 $439.64
25 LT235-75-R17 4 $105.00 $420.00 $119.00 $476.00
26 LT245-75-R16 8 $110.00 $880.00 $92.00 $736.00
27 LT245-75-R17 4 $135.00 $540.00 $83.60 $334.40
28 LT265-70-R16 12 $98.00 $1,176.00 $96.20 $1,154.40
29 LT265-70-R17 4 $145.00 $580.00 $115.00 $460.00
30 LT285-85-R16 4 $140.00 $560.00 $139.00 $556.00
31 P225-60-R16 52 $77.00 $4,004.00 $77.00 $4,004.00
32 P225-60-R18 12 $110.00 $1,320.00 $110.00 $1,320.00
33 P235-55-R17 31 $103.00 $3,193.00 $103.00 $3,193.00
34 P265-75-R16 4 $118.00 $472.00 $100.00 $400.00
35 225-60-R16 12 $77.00 $924.00 $77.77 $933.24
36 16.9-30 6-ply Rear Tractor Tire 4 $430.00 $1,720.00 $472.48 $1,889.92
37 18.4-30 8-ply Rear Tractor Tire 4 $555.00 $2,220.00 $595.14 $2,380.56
38 12.4-24 8-ply Rear Tractor Tire 4 $300.00 $1,200.00 $336.70 $1,346.80
39 14.9-28 6-ply Rear Tractor Tire 4 $340.00 $1,360.00 $395.60 $1,582.40

40  |38-14-20NHS 8-ply Rear Tractor Tire 4 $0.00 $399.00
41 23-8.5-12NHS 4-ply Front Tractor Tire 4 $80.00 $320.00 $55.00 $220.00
42 16.00-16 6-ply 3-rib Front Tractor Tire 4 $74.00 $296.00 $85.12 $340.48
43 |7.50-16 6-ply 3-rib Front Tractor Tire 4 $99.00 $396.00 $122.76 $491.04
44  |Bobcat HD Beadguard 10-16.5, or Approved Equivalent 4 $145.00 $580.00 $123.00 $492.00
45 |Carlisle 13-5.00-6, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $24.00 $96.00 $13.92 $55.68
46  |Carlisle 13-6.00-6, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $28.00 $112.00 $18.00 $72.00
47  |Carlisle 13-6.5-6, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $28.00 $112.00 $19.46 $77.84
48 |Carlisle 16.5-6.5-8, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $28.00 $112.00 $23.70 $94.80
49  |Carlisle 18.5-8.5-8, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $48.00 $192.00 $43.00 $172.00
50 |Carlisle 18-8.5-5.8, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $48.00 $192.00 $35.20 $140.80
51 |Carlisle 22-11-10, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $53.00 $212.00 $56.82 $227.28
52 |Carlisle 22-9.0-10, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $67.00 $268.00 $61.19 $244.76
53 |Carlisle 23-10.5-12, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $62.00 $248.00 $59.55 $238.20
54  |Carlisle 24-12-12, 4-ply, or Approved Equivalent 4 $77.00 $308.00 $63.90 $255.60
Tire Total: $125,978.29 Tire Total: $127,608.87
Tire Toal when Item #40 is ommitted for fair comparison: $126,012.87

Tubes
Item No. Description Quantity Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

1 12.4R24 Radial Tube 1 $33.00 $33.00 $25.08 $25.08
2 14.9R24 Radial Tube 6 $40.00 $240.00 $39.70 $238.20
3 18.4R30 Radial Tube 1 $52.00 $52.00 $45.06 $45.06
4 18.4R34 Radial Tube 6 $59.00 $354.00 $46.97 $281.82
Tube Total: $679.00 Tube Total: $590.16
Grand Total when Item #40 is ommitted for fair Comparison: $126,603.03

Name of Bidder:

Total Bid (ire otal + Tube Total) * $126,657.29|| Total Bid (rire otal + Tube Total) * $128,199.03

Dubois County Tire Trusty Tires

***Recommend accepting Trusty Tire's bid.***




Iltem #9 Fuel

Bidder

89 Octane Unleaded Gasoline

No2 Ultra Low Sulfer Diesel Fuel

No2 High Sulfer Diesel Fuel

(Off
(On Road Diesel) Road Diesel)
10 Day Net 30 Day Net 10 Day Net 30 Day Net 10 Day Net 30 Day Net Remote Tanks
Petroleum Traders Corporation No Bid $2.3787 No Bid 2.4829 No Bid 2.4929 No Bid
Petroleum Traders Corporation No Bid $2.6824 No Bid 2.8018 No Bid 28311 No Bid
Alternate Fixed Price Bid
Key Oil Company $2.3590 $2.4090 2.479 2.529 2.483 2.543 2.619
Miller Oil Company

No Unit Prices given.Prices based on Opis gross average day Louisville rack price at time of order plus a markup.

***Recommend getting quotes from each vendor at time of order.***



Items # 10 - Road Name Signs & Posts

Bidder
Description
Stello Products ROCAL, Inc. Allied Municipal Supply Hall Signs
Size Unit Price
18 x 8 x .080 $10.50 $18.21 $3.91 $10.42
20 x 8 x..080 $11.00 $18.89 $9.84 $11.17
24 x 8 x .080 $13.00 $20.26 $14.47 $12.66
30 x 8 x..080 $16.00 $22.37 $14.34 $16.08
36 x 8 x..080 $19.50 $24.42 $17.20 $18.32
42 x 8 x .080 $22.50 $26.47 $20.07 $20.57
48 x 8 x .080 $27.00 $28.58 $22.93 $24.26
54 x 8 x .080 $32.00 $30.63 $25.80 $26.66
60 x 8 x .080 $36.00 $32.68 $28.67 $30.13
Other Signs (Diamond Grade for Stop Signs, High Intensity for everything else)
5x 7 x.080 $2.00 $1.08 $1.10 $2.71
6 x 24 x .080 $5.00 $4.48 $4.18 $4.92
9 x 12 x.080 $4.00 $3.36 $3.10 $3.86
10 x 30 x .080 $9.80 $9.32 $7.80 $9.67
12 x 6 x .080 $2.50 $2.24 $2.09 $2.77
12 x 12 x .080 $4.00 $4.48 $4.10 $5.03
12 x 18 x .080 $6.00 $6.72 $6.20 $7.12
12 x 36 x .080 $11.00 $13.44 $12.20 $13.50
14 x 6.5 x .080 $3.00 $2.82 $2.70 $4.67
18 x 6 x.080 $5.00 $3.36 $3.10 $3.81
18 x 9 x .080 $5.00 $5.06 $4.70 $5.48
18 STOP x .080 $20.25 $16.85 $12.25 $10.34
18 M1-6 $9.50 $12.08 $9.40 $15.42
18 x 18 x .080 $12.50 $10.08 $9.10 $10.46
18 x 24 x .080 $12.50 $13.44 $12.20 $13.61
21 x 15 x .080 $9.25 $9.81 $8.90 $11.15
24 x 8 x .080 $5.65 $5.96 $5.50 $6.35
24 x 10 x .080 $7.65 $7.48 $6.80 $7.87
24 x 12 x .080 $8.50 $8.96 $8.15 $9.30
24 x 24 x .080 $17.00 $17.92 $16.30 $17.87
24" STOP x .080 $35.00 $29.96 $25.45 $30.61
24 X 30 x..080 $21.50 $22.40 $20.40 $22.13
24 x 36 x.080 $25.50 $26.88 $24.50 $26.40
24 YIELD x .080 $9.95 $10.96 $15.30 $11.89
24 M1-1 $17.00 $19.92 $28.00 $39.62
24 M1-6 $17.00 $19.92 $28.00 $25.93
27.25 x 16.625 $13.90 $14.11 $13.00 $20.30
30 x 15 x .080 $12.20 $14.02 12.50 $14.11
30 x 18 x .080 $16.00 $16.80 $15.25 $16.80
30 x 30 x .080 $26.00 $28.00 $24.60 $27.56
30" Stop x .080 $52.00 $46.81 $38.60 $47.30
30" Yield x .080 $19.95 $14.14 $15.90 $15.09
30" Pentagon x .080 $26.00 $28.00 $25.40 $26.33
30" Circle x .080 $29.95 $28.00 $25.40 $29.33
30" M1-6 x .080 $26.00 $30.00 $26.09 $34.93
30 x 36 x .080 $29.95 $33.60 $30.50 $32.90
36 x 12 x .080 $12.00 $13.44 $12.25 $13.50
36 x 24 x .080 $25.00 $26.88 $24.50 $26.40
Brackets (fill in)
12-inch bracket $10.75 No Bid $14.96 $11.25
Posts
12-ft, 3Ib/ft, Green "U" Channel Post $22.85 No Bid $21.10 $21.42
Other (fill in)

***Recommend accepting Allied Municipal Suppy's bid.***




Iltem #11 High Density Polyethylene Culvert Pipe

N-12 HDPE CPI Big G Supply | SCuthem Indiana
(Diameter) — Sl
Unit Price per LFT

4" No Bid 0.77 No Bid
6" No Bid $1.93 $2.01
8" No Bid $3.63 $3.80
10" No Bid $3.93 $4.11
12" $4.93 $4.48 $4.68
15" $6.50 $6.06 $6.34
18" $9.19 $8.87 $9.27
24" $14.78 $14.19 $14.84
30" $22.00 $20.96 $21.91
36" $27.58 $26.95 $28.18
42" $47.29 $38.08 No Bid
48" $57.34 $46.18 No Bid
60" $92.38 $75.90 No Bid

***Recommend accepting Big G Supply’s bid.***




ltem #12 - Misc. Excavation Work

***Recommend accepting all quotes.***
(See following pages)



EXCEL lll.-- 5710 Uticapgiﬁg:s:as'burg Road
EXCAVAT' N G INC . Sellersburg, Indiana 47172

P.O. Box 548
Jeffersonville, IN 47131

Harrison County Highway Department 12/3/10
3185 Harrison Way NW
Corydon, IN 47112

RE: 2011 Annual Bid

RATE SHEET
Dozer, Komatsu D39, 21,000 LBS $ 85.00 Per Hr.
Dozer, CAT D6, 46,400 LBS $150.00 Per Hr.
High Lift, Cat 953, 30,500 LBS $105.00 Per Hr. |
Excavator, Komatsu PC78, 18,000 LBS $ 85.00 Per Hr.
Excavator, Komatsij PC200, 47,000 LBS $105.00 Per Hr.
Excavator, Komatsu, PC220, 55,000 LBS $115.00 Per Hr.
Excavator, Komatsu, PC300, 78,000 LBS $130.00 Per Hr.
Backhoe, Case 580, 21,600 LBS S 85.00 Per Hr.
Compactor, Cat CS433, 14,635 LBS S 80.00 Per Hr.
Wheel Loader, Cat 924, 25,400 LBS $ 90.00 Per Hr.
Motor Grader, Cat 120, 27,600 LBS $150.00 Per Hr.
Tri-Axle, Dump Truck S 75.00 Per Hr.
Single Axle Dump Truck $ 60.00 Per Hr.

** Eight (8) Hour Minimum Per Piece, Per Day**

Per Specifications

Office Phone: (812) 246-0857 + Fax (812) 246-0855

Email; excelexcavating@sbcglobal.net
Equal Opportunity Employer



Item#12 - Misc Excavation Work

/”é =*0id Notes***
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ANNUAL BID FOR 2011

MILLER TRENCHING LLC
7160 DEATRICK RD SE ELIZABETH, IN 47117

To:

Entry

HARRISON COUNTY

HIGHWAY DEPARTMENT

3185 Harrison Way

Corydon, IN 47112

812-738-2920
Type Description
CASE BACKHOE
CASE BACKHOE

CATERPILLER HIGH-LIFT
CASE EXCAVATOR

ALLIED RAMMER HAMMER

Model
580 SM

580 SM

= 939

E66N

QUOTE FOR MISCELLANEQOUS EXCAVATION WORK THROUGHOUT HARRISON COUNTY INDIANA

BY 8:30 A.M. LOCAL TIME DECEMBER 06, 2010

DALE ] MILLER - 812-969-2920 CELL 812-968-5140

Date: 11/29/10

Weight
16,000 LB

16,000 LB
24,000 LB

18 TON

4,000 LB

' Hourly Rate

$

75.00

75.00

85.00

95.00

130.00



Items # 12 — Misc. Excavation Work

***Bid Notes***

2011

Jeff Lillpop

dba Arty’s Logging

7800 East Highway 11, SE
Elizabeth, IN 47117

(812) 969-3124

Equipment/Service Amount per hour
320 Cat excavator (43,400 Ibs.) $120 per hour
420 Cat backhoe (15,772 Ibs.) $85 per hour
540 John Deere skidder (25,000 Ibs.) $95 per hour
550 John Deere dozer (22,000 1bs.) $85 per hour
Mack truck & trailer $85 per hour
10” Vemeer brush chipper $60 per hour
Utility truck with tools $25 per hour
Heavy equipment operator $25 per hour

(for equipment provided by county only)
Chainsaw and operator $25 per hour

Labor hand $22 per hour




R.L. Vuckson Excavating, Inc.

P.O. Box 391

Scottsburg, IN 47170

Ph. 812-752-6884
Fax 812-967-6341

Harrison County Hishway Department

Item #12 Miscellaneous Excavation Work

Type Model Operating Weight Price/Hr.
Dozer D-5-G 19,000 Lbs 90.00
Dozer D-6-D 38,000 Lbs 100.00
Compactor 815 38,200 Lbs 125.00
Grader 12-G 29,350 Lbs 100.00
Excavator 320C-L 46,000 Lbs 100.00
Excavator 225DLC 58,900 Lbs 125.00
Backhoe 416-C 14,000 Lbs 75.00
Truck Crane  HTC-35 66,000 Lbs 110.00
Crawler Crane LS138 140,000 Lbs 175.00

COPRY



M( EXCAVATION &
CONSTRUCTION co.

Mark Klinstiver, Owner

11186 Sunset Strip Rd. SE

Laconia, IN 47135
(812) 737-2112 Home
(502) 468-9625 Cell

Date: 12/01/10

Estimate for item #12
Miscellaneous excavation work.

Harrison Co.Hwy.Dept.

Quarry Rd.
Corydon, IN 47112

Description Per. Hour
Here are my price's for the 2011 year. i
Cat 963 B trackloader 43,500ib. 160hp. $90.00
Cat 613 B scraper 32,000lb. 11yard cap. $90.00
John Deere 510 Backhoe 15,000lb. 75hp. $70.00
Stump grinding 7500lb.  70hp. $70.00

COPRY



¢¢¢¢¢¢¢

EST. 1950

Gohmann Asphalt and Construction Inc.
P.O. Box 2428

Clarksville, IN 47131-2428

Phone (312) 282-1349

FAX (312) 288-2168

www.gohmannasphalt.com

GOHMANN
ASPHALT ~+ CONSTRUCTION
INC.

December 6, 2010

Harrison County Engineer’s Office

Harrison County Courthouse, Room 107

300 North Capitol Avenue

Corydon, IN 47112

Attention: Kevin Russel

RE: Annual Bids for Calendar Year 2011
Subject: Item # 12, Misc. Excavation Work
Dear Mr. Russel:

Gohmann Asphalt and Construction Inc. hereby submits the following hourly rates for
equipment to be used throughout the county in the 2010 Calendar Year.

PC200 Excavator w/operator $151.00 per hour
Case 580 Backhoe w/operator $109.00 per hour
D4 Dozer w/operator $113.00 per hour -
D6 Dozer w/operator $153.00 per hour
12G Grader w/operator $151.00 per hour
DD24 Vibratory Roller w/operator $100.00 per hour
DD90 Vibratory Roller w/operator $130.00 per hour
SD77DX Sheepsfoot Roller w/operator $130.00 per hour
Mobe/Demobe per each $400.00 per each

These rates will be used with the hours used on site for invoicing with the following exception:
There will be an 8 hour minimum per each piece per move. To cover daily operator minimums,
at least one piece of equipment will be charged for each operator as follows: show-up but not
worked = 2 hours pay, work less than 4 hours = 4 hours pay, work over 4 hours = pay hours
worked. The mobilization cost includes moving equipment to and from site per each piece. The
above rates do not include overtime, labor, supervision, pickups, small tools, materials, or

trucking.

B CORY

<" Jim Horton, Estimator/Engineer
Gohmann Asphalt and Construction Inc.

EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER

MREMBER e

NAPA

> w—

-
ASPHALT

e AL A iICA

PeRETMIZ SAPABNT SEDESVRTY A7 RERIBERE




Item # 12 - Misc. Excavation Work

***Bid Notes***
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Item # 12 - Misc. Excavation Work

=»*Bid Notes***
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S & M NIX ENTERPRISES, LLC.
13060 Fredericksburg Rd. NW

Depauw, In 47115

To whom it may concern,

I, Glenn Steven Nix, owner and operator of S & M Nix Enterprises, LLC., am
submitting a bid of $75.00 per hour for backhoe work, $85.00 per hour for bulldozer/high
lift work, tri-axel work $75.00 per hour, trenching at $1.25 per foot, and road boring at
$10.00 per foot. If you have any questions please do not hesitate to call 812-347-2920) or

812-946-0535. Thank you for your time and consideration.

— A a - [..
Glenn Steven Nix Date
/ l C;‘\L/kms\p (o ~{-(O
B 7 il
Moira Nix Date
State of Indiana .. N AL ML
County of Harrison .

p. G
Before me, a Notary Public, personally appeared the above named UL wn oUW gi*ﬁé&
and swore that the statements contained in the foregonx%r document are true
and correct. Subscribed and sworn to before me this " day of s
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My commission Expires: Lt 1D I L BV RN . DN gy
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Dan Cristiani Excavating Co., Inc.
1221 Old Highway 31 E
Clarkville, IN 47129

812-282-9866 phone

812-282-9908 fax

Contractor Price List - Equipment With Operator
Harrison County Highway Department

2011 Prices
Backhoe Price/Hour| {Wheel Loader Price/Hour
JD310E/G 4WD - 15,000 LBS. $70.00] [KUBOTA 420 -9,500LBS $70.00
D710 4WD - 26,000 LBS. $80.00] (KOMATSU 50 - 9,000 LBS $70.00
KOMATSU WA180 - 21,000 LBS $90.00
KOMATSU WA250 - 25,000 LBS $95.00
Landscape Loader KOMATSU WA380-45,00LBS $120.00
CASE 580XT 4WD - 11,000 LBS. $70.00f |KOMATSU WAS00 - 65,000 LBS $135.00
CASE 580XT 4WD W/GRADER BOX- 11,000 LBS. $70.001 |*All loaders are equipped w/quick attach attachments
Quick attach brooms $35.00
Quick attach forks No Charge
Skidsteer
BOBCAT 185S - 6,000 LBS. $60.00] |Pan Scra
BOBCAT180-7,000 LBS $60.00| }(JD9400+ 1 17 yd Pan - 45,000LBS $125.00
ASV T-60 TRACKLOADER- 6,200 LBS $60.00] |JD9520 + 1 17 yd. Pan - 45,000 LBS $125.00
JD9520 + 2 17 yd. Pans - 60,000 LBS $150.00
FIAT 2628 - 68,000 LBS $150.00
Dozer
JD450H - 15,000 LBS $70.00
JDE50H - 20,000 LBS $75.00) |Motor Grader
JD750C - 32,000 LBS $90.00] |Fiat 65C - 16,000 LBS $85.00
CATDENXL - 42,000 LBS $90.00
CATDERXL - 45,000 LBS $105.00
. Ira iscing, or Rollin
JD 5520 wiioader - 7,500 LBS $65.00
Crawler Loader (HiL ift) JD 5525 wiloader - 8,500 LBS $65.00
CAT939 - 22,000 LBS $85.00] }|JD 6030 -20,000LBS $75.00
CAT 953C - 32,000 LBS $95.00] 1JD 6420 wiicader - 10,000 LBS ° $70.00
JD 7400 - 12,000 LBS $80.00
JD 9520 - 45,000 LBS $95.00
Excavator
iHI 15 - 3850 LBS $65.00 |Trencher
HI 30 - 6560 LBS $70.00] {Vermeer Walk Behind RT200 $65.00
KOMATSU 78 - 17,000 LBS $75.00f |Vermeer Ride on V4150 $75.00
JD110 - 27,000 LBS $85.00
KOMATSU PC138 -28,000LBS $85.00
D160 - 35,000 LBS $95.00] [Roller
JD200 - 44,000 LBS $100.00] IR SD 70 66" W/Pads - 16,000 LBS $75.00
JD230 - 52,000 LBS $110.00) |IR SD 100 84" W/Pads - 25,000 LBS $85.00
JD 230 W/THUMB - 52,000 LBS $115.00] {CAT 815B W/Blade - 46,000 LBS $100.00
KOMATSU PC200LCS - 47,000 LBS $100.00
KOMATSU PC220LC - 51,000 LBS $110.00
KOMATSU PC220LC6LE - 54,000 LBS $110.00| [Machines w/hammer units
KOMATSU PC300LC6 - 73,000 LBS $120.00] 1JD310E w/1,000 Ibs hammer - 16,000 lbs $90.00
JD270 W/THUMB-56,000 LBS $120.00f |JD710D w/1,500 ibs hammer - 27,500 Ibs $125.00
JD160 excavator w/2,000 Ibs hammer - 37,000ibs $160.00
JD200 excavator w/3,000 lbs hammer - 47,000ibs $200.00
JD230 excavator w/5,000 lbs hammer - 57,000lbs $215.00
Forklift
Clark; Teledyne D5M; Toyota SFG25; Hyster 540C $60.00
Specialty Equipment
Billable Labor $35.00] [Vermeer HG600 Horizontal Grinder - 72,000 tbs $320.00
Field Surveyor $65.00) [Vermeer TG800 Tub Grinder - 100,000 lbs $400.00
Office Survey Work $40.00} |[Komatsu PC220-6 W/Shear - 61,000 lbs $110.00
Superintendent $40.00] [Vermeer D7x11 Directional Bore 6,000 Ibs $75.00
Trucks
Single Axie Dump Truck $65.00
Tri-Axie Dump Truck $75.00
Lowboy and Semi tactor $90.00
Dumpster Truck $80.00
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Item # 12 - Misc. Excavation Work
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