
 
 

Item #1 – Stone 
 
Bidders: Corydon Stone & Asphalt 
  Vulcan Materials 
  Davis Crushed Stone 
  Robertson Crushed Stone & Lime 
 

Accepted all bids. 
 
 

Item #2 – Cold Mix Asphalt 
 
Bidders: Corydon Stone & Asphalt – only bidder 
 

Accepted CSA’s bid. 
 
 

Item #3 – Base Stabilization 
 

No Bids 
 
 

Item #4 – HMA Pavement 
 
Bidders: Corydon Stone & Asphalt – only bidder 
 

Accepted CSA’s bid. 
 
 

Item #5 – Pavement Markings 
 
Bidders: Interstate Road Management 

 
Accepted Interstate Road Management’s bid. 

 
 

Item #6 – Guardrail 
 
Bidders: CPI Supply 
  James H. Drew 
    

Accepted James H. Drew’s bid. 
 
 



 
 

Item # 7 – Corrugated Metal Pipe 
Pre Engineered Bridge Packages 

Slope Stabilization and Erosion Control Products 
Rehabilitation Products 

 
 
Bidders: CPI Supply 
  St. Regis Culvert 
 

Accepted CPI’s bid. 
 
 

Item 8 – Tires & Tubes 
 
Bidders: Trusty & Sons 
  S & R Truck Tire Center 
   

Accepted Trusty & Son’s bid. 
 
 

Item #9 – Fuel 
    

No Bids 
 
 

Item #10 – Road Name Signs and Road Name Sign Posts 
 
Bidders: Hall Signs 
  Stello Products, Inc 
 

Accepted Stello Products’ bid. 
 

Item #11 – Road Signs & Road Sign Posts 
 

Bidders: Hall Signs 
Stello Products, Inc 

 
 

 
Accepted Hall Signs’ bid. 

 
 
 
 



 
Item 12 Miscellaneous Excavation Work 

 
Quotes from: Arty’s Logging 
  McAleese Excavating 
  S & M Nix Enterprises 
  Gohmann Asphalt & Construction 
 

Accepted all quotes. 
 

Item # 13 – HDPE Culvert Pipe 
 
Bidders: CPI Supply 
  St. Regis Culvert 
  Southern Indiana Supply 
 

Accepted  Southern Indiana Supply’s bid. 
   



Robertson 
Crushed Stone

Vulcan 
Materials

Davis Crushed 
Stone and Lime

Corydon Stone 
& Asphalt Inc.

Item Description

INDOT #2 $4.85 $6.25 $5.80 $5.70
INDOT #5 $5.00 $6.25 $5.80 $5.70
INDOT #8 $5.10 $6.65 No Bid $5.90
INDOT #9 $5.10 No Bid $5.80 $6.55
INDOT #11 $5.20 $7.50 $5.80 $7.30
INDOT #12 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.40
INDOT #43 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.90
INDOT #91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.90
INDOT #53 $4.65 $6.25 $5.80 $5.90
INDOT #73 $4.65 $6.25 $5.80 $5.90
Shot $2.65 $6.00 $4.60 $5.15
Rip Rap $6.15 $7.25 $5.80 $6.85
Pugmill No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.65
Crushed Lime $4.65 $5.00 $5.80 $4.80
Ag Lime $4.65 $5.00 $5.80 $4.80
Dirt $5.40 No Bid No Bid $1.65
#201 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.05
Asphalt Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.90
Surge Rock No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.30
Crusher Run No Bid $6.25 No Bid $5.90

Hourly Delivery Rate $70.00 $85.00 $65.00 $70.00

Item #1 Stone

Unit Price per Ton F.O.B. at the Quarry



Corydon Stone & 
Asphalt Inc.

Item Description Unit Price per Ton 
F.O.B. at the Plant

Size 2 No Bid
Size 5 No Bid
Size 8 No Bid
Size 9 No Bid

Size 11 $92.00
Size 5D No Bid

Item #2 Cold Mix Asphalt (CMA)



No Bids Received

Item #3 Base Stabilization and/or Dust Control



Corydon Stone & 
Asphalt Inc.

Item Description Unit Price per Ton 
F.O.B. at the Plant

HMA Base $46.00
HMA Intermediate $46.00
HMA Surface $48.00

Hourly Delivery Rate $75.00

Item #4 HMA Pavement



Interstate Road Management

Unit Price per LFT
Line, Traffic Paint, Solid, White, 4-inch $0.083
Line, Traffic Paint, Broken, White, 4-inch $0.083
Line, Traffic Paint, Solid, Yellow, 4-inch $0.083
Line, Traffic Paint, Broken, Yellow, 4-inch $0.083

Item #5 Pavement Markings

Item Description



James H. Drew CPI

Item Description

10 Ga. Guardrail 12' 6" Galv. w/Hdw. LF $10.20 No Bid
12 Ga. Guardrail 12' 6" Galv. w/Hdw. LF $8.25 $10.44
12 Ga. Guardrail 12' 6" Galv. (Shop Curved) w/Hdw. LF $10.20 No Bid
Michigan End Shoe Each $41.00 No Bid
Standard End Wings Each $36.00 $40.80
Posts 4" x 6" x 6' 0" Galv. w/Hdw. Each $50.00 $63.92
Posts 4" x 6" x 7' 0" Galv. w/Hdw. Each $57.00 No Bid
Posts 6" x 6" x 6' 3" Galv. w/Hdw. Each $172.00 No Bid
Offset Brackets 4" x 6" Each $18.75 $16.32
Offset Brackets 6" x 6" Each $34.00 No Bid
"C" Splice Plates Each $102.00 $129.20
Bridge Posts 6" x 6" x Length, Galv. LF $37.80 No Bid
Bridge Inserts for Bridge Rail Posts (3/4" - Furnished & Installed) Each $37.28 No Bid
Bridge Post Spacers Each $7.88 No Bid
3/4" Bridge Post Hardware Each $5.51 No Bid
5" Channel, Galv., Punched 6' 3" LF No Bid No Bid
25' 0" x 12 Ga New Guardrail LF No Bid $9.68

12 Ga. Guardrail w/Hardware LF $2.35 No Bid
4" x 6" x 5' 9" or 6' 0" Posts w/Hdw., painted Each $8.00 No Bid
4" x 6" x 5' 9" or 6' 0" Posts w/Hdw., galv. Each $12.00 No Bid
6" x 6" x 6' 3" Posts Galv. w/Hdw. Each $18.00 No Bid
Offset Brackets 4" x 6" Each $4.00 No Bid
Offset Brackets 6" x 6" Each $7.50 No Bid
End Wings w/Hardware, Galv. Each $15.00 No Bid
Michigan End Shoe Each $18.50 No Bid
"C" Splice Plates Each $21.00 No Bid
Channel, Galv. LF $2.75 No Bid

1 - 300 LF $1,600 Minimum No Bid
301 - 500 LF LF $4.50 No Bid
501 - 750 LF LF $4.35 No Bid
751 - 1,000 LF LF $4.20 No Bid
Over 1,000 LF LF $4.00 No Bid
Installation of Buried End Each $50.00 No Bid

Item #6 Guardrail

Used Guardrail - If Available

Installation Prices

New Guardrail
Price

Unit



Item #7

Corrugated Metal Pipe

Pre Engineered Bridge Packages

Slope Stabilization and Erosion Control Products

Rehabilitation Products

***Too many items to list…bids on file in the Auditor's office***



Quantity Unit Price 
$/each Amount Unit Price 

$/each Amount

1 Drive Caps (Re-Caps) - 11R22.5 Accutread HDL or Approved Equivalent 25 No Bid #VALUE! No Bid #VALUE!
2 Steer Tires (11R22.5 Continental HSR 16 Ply or Approved Equivalent) 25 $282.00 $7,050.00 $250.00 $6,250.00
3 Drive Tires (11R22.5 Firestone T831 16 Ply or Approved Equivalent) 75 $256.00 $19,200.00 $256.00 $19,200.00
4 Service Truck (265/70R19.5 Goodyear G124 or Approved Equivalent) 6 $300.00 $1,800.00 No Bid #VALUE!
5 Service Truck (265/70R19.5 Goodyear G159 or Approved Equivalent) 10 $309.00 $3,090.00 No Bid #VALUE!
6 235/85R16 Firestone Transforce HT 10Ply 8 $88.50 $708.00 $88.50 $708.00
7 9.50R16.5 Firestone Transforce HT 10Ply 8 $100.58 $804.64 No Bid #VALUE!
8 Light Truck LT 245/75R16 8 $92.00 $736.00 No Bid #VALUE!
9 Light Truck LT 265/75R16 12 $139.84 $1,678.08 No Bid #VALUE!
10 14.00-24 Firestone Grader 12 Ply or Approved Equivalent 42 $476.00 $19,992.00 $402.42 $16,901.64
11 380/85R24 Firestone Rdial AT DT or Approved Equivalent 20 $868.00 $17,360.00 $540.04 $10,800.80
12 480/85R34Firestone Radial 23 or Approved Equivalent 20 $1,147.00 $22,940.00 $694.13 $13,882.60
13 19.5L-24 Firestone Utility R-4 10Ply or Approved Equivalent 2 $708.00 $1,416.00 $510.52 $1,021.04
14 12-16.5 Firestone Duraforce HD 10Ply or Approved Equivalent 2 $222.00 $444.00 $150.02 $300.04
15 12.5/80-18 Firestone Super Trac12 Ply or Approved Equivalent 2 $340.00 $680.00 $252.55 $505.10

Item No. Description Quantity Unit Price 
$/each Amount Unit Price 

$/each Amount

1 Drive Caps (Re-Caps) - 11R22.5 Accutread HDL or Approved Equivalent 1 $42.00 $42.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Steer Tires (11R22.5 Continental HSR 16 Ply or Approved Equivalent) 6 $68.00 $408.00 No Bid No Bid
3 Drive Tires (11R22.5 Firestone T831 16 Ply or Approved Equivalent) 1 $61.00 $61.00 No Bid No Bid
4 Service Truck (265/70R19.5 Goodyear G124 or Approved Equivalent) 6 $83.00 $498.00 No Bid No Bid

Tubes

S & R Truck Tire Center Trusty & Sons

Item #8 - Tires & Tubes

DescriptionItem No.

Tires



No Bids

Item #9 Fuel



Description Stello Products, Inc.* Hallsigns

Finished Finished
Engineer Grade Engineer Grade

18 x 8 x .080 $9.50 $11.24
20 x 8 x .080 $10.00 $12.07
24 x 8 x .080 $12.00 $13.73
30 x 8 x .080 $15.00 $17.42
36 x 8 x .080 $18.50 $19.91
42 x 8 x .080 $21.15 $22.41
48 x 8 x .080 $25.75 $26.38
54 x 8 x .080 No Bid $29.03
60 x 8 x .080 No Bid $32.77

*Add 15% for Orders Less Than 25

Size (ft) 12 12
Description Green Green

Weight (lb./ft) 3 3
Price/Ft $25.00 $32.16

Size (in.) Description Type Price
12 Flat Blade 90 Deg. Cap. $13.00
12 Flat Blade 90 Deg. Crosspiece $13.00

12 U 180F $11.25
12 U 90F $11.25
12 U 38F $11.25
12 U CRF $11.25

Item #10 Road Name Signs & Road Name Sign Posts

BRACKETS

Stello Products, Inc.

Hallsigns

U-CHANNEL 

Size



1 to 24 25+ 1 to 24 25+
5 x 7 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.81 $3.63 $2.56

6 x 24 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.35 $8.73 $4.33
9 x 12 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.18 $6.71 $3.41

10 x 30 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.57 $17.62 $8.43
12 x 6 x .080 $3.36 $3.00 $5.59 $4.99 No Bid $2.98 $4.67 $2.47
18 x 8 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 x 12 x .080 $6.17 $5.51 $9.18 $8.20 No Bid $5.46 $8.84 $4.43
12 x 18 x .080 $7.04 $6.29 $13.78 $12.30 No Bid $7.76 $12.83 $6.22
12 x 36 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.77 $24.90 $11.69
14 x 6.5 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.94 $7.08 $4.29

18 x 6 x.080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.13 $6.66 $3.36
18 x 9 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.96 $9.76 $4.81

18 STOP x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.22 $18.82 $11.87
CALIF STD No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.22 $28.82 $18.91

18 M1-6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.42 $24.02 $14.06
18 x 18 x .080 $12.97 $11.58 $20.66 $18.45 No Bid $11.43 $19.03 $9.12
18 x 24 x .080 $16.92 $15.11 $27.55 $24.60 No Bid $14.90 $25.03 $11.82
21 x 15 x .080 $13.66 $12.20 $20.01 $17.87 No Bid $12.09 $19.48 $9.85
24 x 8 x .080 $7.84 $7.00 $12.21 $10.90 No Bid $6.92 $11.43 $5.55

24 x 10 x .080 $9.73 $8.69 $15.24 $13.61 No Bid $8.59 $14.21 $6.87
24 x 12 x .080 $11.52 $10.29 $18.37 $16.40 No Bid $10.16 $16.91 $8.10
24 x 24 x .080 $22.27 $19.88 $36.74 $32.80 No Bid $19.59 $33.10 $15.48

24" STOP x .080 $21.49 $19.19 $35.84 $32.00 No Bid $19.93 $32.45 $14.46
24 X 30 x .080 $27.61 $24.65 $35.90 $32.05 No Bid $24.27 $41.16 $19.14
24 x 36 x.080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.97 $49.24 $22.81

24 YIELD x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.69 $19.78 $10.02
24 M1-1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.71 $56.22 $38.19
24 M1-6 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.94 $41.45 $23.67

27.25 x 16.625 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.26 $35.88 $21.83
30 x 15 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.45 $26.00 $12.24
30 x 18 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.41 $31.08 $14.56
30 x 30 x .080 $34.40 $30.71 $55.94 $49.95 No Bid $30.24 $51.35 $23.82
30" Stop x .080 $32.48 $29.00 $55.44 $49.50 No Bid $29.06 $50.17 $22.23
30" Yield x .080 $18.45 $16.47 $31.36 $28.00 No Bid $16.33 $26.46 $12.67

30" Pentagon x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.69 $49.80 $22.27
30" Circle x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.58 $44.69 $17.16
30" M1-6 x .080 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.08 $59.19 $31.40
30 x 36 x .080 $41.09 $36.69 $68.88 $61.50 No Bid $36.12 $61.45 $28.41
36 x 12 x .080 $16.81 $15.01 $27.55 $24.60 No Bid $14.79 No Bid No Bid
36 x 12 x .100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.78 $13.56
36 x 15 x .100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.74 $33.41 $16.89
36 x 24 x .080 $32.96 $29.43 $55.10 $49.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
36 x 36 x .100 $55.53 $49.58 $82.66 $73.80 No Bid $48.77 $79.17 $39.52
36" Stop x .100 $50.40 $45.00 $79.41 $70.90 No Bid $46.45 $76.85 $36.75
36" Yield x .100 $29.37 $26.22 $42.24 $37.71 No Bid $25.95 $41.15 $20.61
36 x 48 x.100 $76.41 $68.22 $111.06 $99.16 No Bid $66.84 $107.38 $54.52
36 x 72 x.100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $111.62 $172.42 $92.75

36 PENTAGON x .100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.37 $76.77 $37.13
36 CIRCLE x .100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.83 $65.23 $25.59

36 N.P.Z x .100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $40.67 $64.99 $32.77
36 M1-1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.36 $88.76 $49.02

48 x 24 x.100 $50.14 $44.77 $73.37 $65.51 No Bid $44.06 $71.08 $35.84
48 x 30 x.100 $63.04 $56.29 $91.95 $82.10 No Bid $55.45 $89.23 $45.18
48 x 36 x.100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.20 $107.73 $54.88
48 x 48 x.100 $102.20 $91.25 $148.25 $132.37 No Bid $89.96 $144.01 $73.53

48 STOP x .100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $87.93 $141.97 $69.05
48 N. P. Z. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $70.45 $113.69 $56.41

60 x 24 x.125 $86.13 $76.90 $117.60 $105.00 No Bid $76.10 $120.69 $76.22
60 x 30 x.125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $101.03 $143.26 $87.80
60 x 36 x.125 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $112.30 $162.97 $96.59

Item #11 Road Signs & Sign Posts

Engineering 
Grade

Stello Products, Inc.
Engineering 

Grade
Hi-

Intensity 
Diamond 

Grade 

Hall Signs Inc.*
Hi-Intensity Diamond Grade Size

25+



Equipments Amount/Hr Equipments Amount/Hr
320 Cat excavator (43,400 lbs.) $120.00 1999 416C Cat Backhoe (18,000 lbs) $75.00
420 Cat backhoe (15,772 lbs.) $85.00 2008 287C Cat Skid Steer with Trencher Attachment (14,000 lbs.) $75.00
540 John Deere skidder (25000 lbs.) $90.00 2005 Air Hammer Boring Tool $10.00/ft
550 John Deere dozer (22,000 lbs.) $85.00
Mack truck & trailer $85.00
Utility truck with tools $25.00
Heavy equipment operator (provided by county only) $25.00
Chainsaw and operator $25.00 Gohmann Asphalt & Construction
Labor hand $22.00 Equipments Amount/Hr

PC 200 Excavator w/operator $147.00
Case 580 Backhoe w/operator $105.00
D4 Dozer w/operator $109.00

Equipments Amount/Hr D6 Dozer w/operator $149.00
63 lb Lieberr (between Cat 953-963 capacity) $90.00 12G Grader w/operator $148.00
Backhoe $60.00 DD24 Vibratory Roller w/operator $97.00
Trackhoe (312) $110.00 DD90 Vibratory Roller w/operator $126.00
Skid steer $60.00 SD77DX Sheepsfoot Roller w/operator $126.00

Mobe/Demobe per each $400.00

Item #12 - Misc. Excavation Work
S & M Nix Enterprises, LLCArty's Logging

McAleese Excavating



CPI St. Regis Southern Indiana 
Supply

4" $0.90
6" $2.25 $1.82
8" $3.69 $2.92

10" $4.73 $2.94
12" $5.39 $4.60 $4.39
15" $7.06 $6.00 $5.83
18" $10.66 $8.75 $8.45
24" $16.51 $14.30 $13.87
30" $25.20 $21.00 $19.53
36" $32.40 $31.20 $25.92
42" $42.93 $44.85
48" $51.53 $54.60
60" $84.76

Unit Price per LFT

Item #13 High Density Polyethylene Culvert Pipe
N-12 HDPE 
(Diameter)




